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Imminent Perforation of a Post-Traumatic Scleromalacia
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Scleromalacia is a degenerative thinning of scleral tissue. 
Their general causes are dominated by inflammatory rheuma-
tism and systemic vasculitis. The traumatic cause is very rare. 
We report a rare case of scleromalacia following a minor trau-
ma with localized hernia of the uveal tissue covered by an in-
tact conjunctiva. This is a 90-year-old patient, with no particular 
history, who presented for consultation following the finding of 
the family the

presence of a pigmented mass which has been gradually in-
creasing in size in the left eye over one month. The anamnesis 
revealed a recent notion of contusive trauma by elbowing and 
chronic constipation. The ophthalmological examination found 
a lesion relatively pigmented measuring 3 mm wide, parallel to 
the limbus going from 11 o’clock at 2 o’clock with a margin of 
healthy sclera, the sclera is very thin but seems perforated at 
10 o’clock with herniated choroid covered by an intact conjunc-
tiva; furthermore, the pupil is completely aspirated upwards 
with the presence of a dense subluxated cataract. The patient 
refused any surgical procedure; however, we had nevertheless 
requested a systemic assessment to eliminate non-traumatic 
causes. Our diagnosis was retained in front of the negativity of 
the assessment and the traumatic context.
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